
 
 

Link Group announces Dee McGrath as new Link Fund Administration CEO 
 
5 April 2019: Link Group (ASX: LNK) has announced the appointment of Dee McGrath as the new 
chief executive officer of Link Fund Administration, as part of a suite of management initiatives that 
underline Link Group’s commitment to its clients and technology-led strategy, while further 
enhancing its senior leadership capability.  
 
As CEO of Link Fund Administration, Ms McGrath will oversee Link Group’s administration of many of 
Australia’s superannuation funds. 
 
Managing Director of Link Group John McMurtrie said: “I am delighted to announce that Dee 
McGrath is joining Link Group. Ms McGrath is a high calibre executive and her extensive experience 
in both relationship management and delivering strategic projects will be invaluable to our clients 
and their members and employers.” 
 
Ms McGrath joins Link Group from IBM, where she most recently held the role of Managing Partner, 
Global Business Services. At IBM, Dee was responsible for the strategy, client relationships and 
business performance of IBM’s consulting and professional services business in Australia and New 
Zealand. Prior to IBM, Ms McGrath held senior roles at Visa, Hewlett Packard and NAB. 
 
“Link Group is dedicated to excellence in customer service and Ms McGrath will reinvigorate our 
approach to client engagement, as well as work with the broader Link Group team to help all our 
clients utilise technology to their best advantage,” Mr McMurtrie said. 
 
Ms McGrath will commence her role at Link Group on 3 June 2019.  
 
This appointment, together with other recently announced changes including the establishment of a 
new Operations, Technology & Innovation division, to be led by long-standing Link Group executive 
Paul Gardiner, reinforces Link Group’s commitment to deliver on its client and innovation-led 
strategic plan. 
 
Other recently announced changes include the appointment of Nigel McCammon as Chief 
Operations Officer, Asia Pacific, Operations, Technology & Innovation. Mr McCammon will also join 
Link Group in June and was most recently Head of Mercer Administration Services. 
 
These changes signal Link Group’s continued commitment to enhance its capability to meet the 
changing needs of the industry and its clients. 
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About Link Group (ASX: LNK)  
Link Administration Holdings (Link Group) administers financial ownership data and drives user 
engagement through technology. Underpinned by our investment in technology, people and 
processes, we deliver comprehensive data and information solutions for companies, large asset 
owners and trustees across the globe. We are a market-leading provider of technology-enabled 
administration solutions, continually developing our offerings to expand with our clients’ needs. Our 
core business, which consists of fund administration and securities registration, is complemented by 



our expertise in digital solutions and data analytics. Our clients represent all industries and include 
some of Australia’s largest superannuation funds and the world’s largest corporations. For more 
information, please visit: www.linkgroup.com 
 


